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NEWS RELEASES 

News Release 

FEDERAL EMPLOYEES DONATE A RECORD 5.7 MILLION POUNDS OF NONPERISHABLE FOOD ITEMS 

NATIONWIDE 

During Feds Feed Families 2011 food drive, employees across the country donated to local food banks 
for children, seniors and families in need.  

 

OPM and the CHCO Council announced that federal employees donated 5,793,446 pounds of 
nonperishable food items for the Feds Feed Families 2011 summer food drive. From left to right are Pat 
Tamburrino (CHCO, DOD), William "Billy" Milton (CHCO, USDA), Kathryn Medina (Executive 
Director, CHCO Council), John Berry (Director, OPM), Lynn Brantley (CEO, Capital Area Food Bank), 
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Mike Kane (CHCO, DOE) and Rita Franklin (Deputy CHCO, DOE). USOPM Photo By: Timothy Grant 
09/21/2011 

Washington, DC - The U.S. Office of Personnel Management (OPM) and the Chief Human Capital 
Officers (CHCO) Council announced that federal employees donated 5,793,446 pounds of nonperishable 
food items for the Feds Feed Families (FFF) 2011 summer food drive. That is equivalent to over 64,000 
pounds donated per day. Recognizing the continued need to support America's families, this year's 
collection goal was two million pounds, which was far exceeded. The items were collected nationwide 
and donated to food banks all over the country. 

"Feds Feed Families was a resounding success," said OPM Director John Berry. "This year's goal was 2 
million pounds and federal employees opened up their hearts to deliver an astounding record total of 
food items and other essentials. This is just one more reminder of the generosity of federal employees. 
Over the last few decades, federal employees have given billions of dollars to charity, and they always 
deliver when called to action. Thank you to every federal worker who donated."  

This governmentwide effort included more than 40 agencies. The two agencies that brought in the most 
were our co-chairs, the Department of Defense, which donated 2,004,613 pounds, and the U.S. 
Department of Agriculture, which donated 1,791,393 pounds. All other federal agencies, together, 
donated 1,997,440 pounds. 

Over the past three years, FFF results have increased exponentially. In 2009, the first year of FFF, 
federal employees donated 1 million pounds of nonperishable food items and in 2010 federal employees 
donated 1.7 million pounds.  

FFF, which ran from June 1, 2011, through August 31, 2011, is a federal food drive organized by the 
CHCO Council in partnership with OPM. The drive is a voluntary effort for federal employees to give 
back to the community by helping those in need. 

For more information, visit http://www.fedsfeedfamilies.gov/. 

Page 2 of 3Federal Employees Donate a Record 5.7 Million Pounds of Nonperishable Food Items Na...

11/15/2011mhtml:file://U:\news releases\Federal Employees Donate a Record 5_7 Million Pounds of...



 

- end - 

Our mission is to Recruit, Retain and Honor a World-Class Workforce to Serve the American People. 
OPM supports U.S. agencies with personnel services and policy leadership including staffing tools, 
guidance on labor-management relations and programs to improve work force performance. 

Phone: (202) 606-2402 
FAX: (202) 606-2264 
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